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BEST CITATION - DINESH,, CRITICAL STUDY OF CENTRAL BUREAU OF INVESTIGATION (CBI), INDIAN JOURNAL 
OF LEGAL REVIEW (IJLR), 4 (4) OF 2024, PG. 01-09, APIS – 3920 – 0001 & ISSN - 2583-2344. 

Abstract : 

The Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI) plays a pivotal role in maintaining law and order, ensuring 
justice, and combating corruption in India. Established in 1963, the CBI operates under the jurisdiction 
of the Ministry of Personnel, Public Grievances, and Pensions and is tasked with investigating complex 
and high-profile cases across state and national levels. This abstract explores the structure, functions, 
and legal framework of the CBI, highlighting its key role in maintaining the integrity of the Indian 
administrative system. 

 

 Introduction : 

The Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI) is 
India’s premier investigative agency, tasked 
with probing high-profile and complex cases 
involving corruption, economic crimes, and 
other serious criminal matters. Established in 
1941 as the Special Police Establishment, the CBI 
underwent significant reforms post-
independence, evolving into a multifaceted 
investigative body under the jurisdiction of the 
Ministry of Personnel, Public Grievances, and 
Pensions. Its authority extends across India, 
although it requires consent from state 
governments to investigate within their 
territories. 

The CBI Is often viewed as India’s version of the 
FBI, handling a wide range of cases, from major 
fraud and public sector corruption to sensitive 
political investigations. It is divided into various 
divisions specializing in areas such as anti-
corruption, economic offenses, and special 
crimes, ensuring the expertise needed to deal 
with these complex issues. The CBI operates 
under the supervision of the Department of 
Personnel and Training (DoPT) and is governed 
by the Delhi Special Police Establishment (DSPE) 
Act, 1946. 

Administratively, the CBI is led by a Director, 
appointed by a high-level committee including 
the Prime Minister, Leader of the Opposition, and 

Chief Justice of India (or a Supreme Court 
judge). The Director oversees the functioning of 
the agency, ensuring impartial investigations 
while navigating challenges related to political 
interference and jurisdictional limitations. The 
CBI’s reputation, while prestigious, has faced 
criticism regarding autonomy and 
accountability, raising ongoing debates about 
its independence from political influence. 

History of the Central Bureau of Investigation 
(CBI): 

CBI is India’s most important investigative 
agency, with a history that dates back to the 
British colonial period. Over time, it has evolved 
from a specialized police force focusing on 
corruption into a multi-faceted investigative 
body handling complex cases of national and 
international importance. 

1. Origins (1941): 

The roots of the CBI can be traced back to 
World War II when the British government 
established the Special Police Establishment 
(SPE) in 1941. Its primary purpose was to 
investigate bribery and corruption in the War 
and Supply Department, which was responsible 
for wartime procurement and supplies. 
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2. Post-Independence Era and DSPE Act (1946): 

After India gained independence in 1947, the 
government felt the need to retain the SPE to 
tackle corruption in post-colonial 
administration. Consequently, the Delhi Special 
Police Establishment Act (DSPE Act) was 
enacted in 1946. This law gave the agency 
statutory powers to investigate offenses related 
to corruption and bribery in central government 
departments and public sector undertakings. 

The Delhi Special Police Establishment (DSPE) 
became the formal name of the agency, but its 
role was still narrowly focused on investigating 
corruption cases in government departments. 

3. Formation of the CBI (1963): 

The Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI), as it is 
known today, was established in 1963 by a 
resolution of the Government of India. The Home 
Ministry recommended its creation to combat 
increasing levels of corruption in public life and 
government services. 

The CBI was formed by expanding the role of 
the DSPE. Its jurisdiction was broadened to 
include serious crimes, economic offenses, and 
other types of corruption beyond the 
government sector. 

4. Expansion of Jurisdiction (1960s-1980s): 

Over the years, the CBI’s jurisdiction continued 
to expand. It became the primary agency for 
investigating complex and significant cases,  

including: 

1. Anti-Corruption investigations involving 
central and state government officials. 

2. Economic crimes like fraud, 
embezzlement, and financial scams. 

3. Serious crimes such as murder, 
terrorism, and organized crime. 

The agency’s reputation grew, and it was 
increasingly called upon to investigate cases 
referred by state governments or the Supreme 
Court and High Courts in cases where local law 
enforcement was unable to handle the 
investigations impartially or effectively. 

5. Notable Cases and Growth of Reputation 
(1990s-Present): 

The CBI gained national prominence by 
handling a series of high-profile cases during 
the 1990s and 2000s, including: 

The Hawala Scandal (1990s), which implicated 
top politicians. 

The Bofors Scandal (1980s-1990s), involving 
alleged kickbacks in defense procurement. 

The 2G Spectrum Scam (2010), a major 
telecommunications scandal.  

The Coal Allocation Scam (2012). 

Various cases involving politicians, bureaucrats, 
and corporate fraud. 

During this period, however, the CBI also faced 
increasing criticism for being influenced by 
ruling political parties, particularly when it came 
to cases involving opposition politicians. 

6. Institutional Challenges and Reforms: 

Supreme Court Oversight : In 2013, the Supreme 
Court of India referred to the CBI as a “caged 
parrot,” implying that the agency was being 
controlled by political forces, undermining its 
autonomy. This led to calls for reforms to grant 
the CBI greater functional and financial 
independence. 

Lokpal Act (2013) : The Lokpal and Lokayuktas 
Act, passed in 2013, aimed at giving more 
autonomy to the CBI in matters of anti-
corruption, especially with provisions for 
independent appointments of its director. 

Evaluation of the Central Bureau of 
Investigation  (CBI): 

The Central Bureau of Investigation is widely 
regarded as India’s premier investigative 
agency, but it has faced significant challenges 
in maintaining its credibility and independence. 
Below is an evaluation of its strengths and 
challenges: 
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Strengths of the CBI : 

1. Expertise and Professionalism : 

     The CBI is known for its highly skilled 
personnel, including investigators, forensic 
experts, and legal professionals. Its divisions, 
such as the Anti-Corruption Division, Economic 
Offenses Wing, and Special Crimes Division, are 
tailored to handle specific types of crimes. 

2. High-Profile Investigations : 

     The CBI is often called upon to investigate 
cases of national importance and high 
complexity, where local law enforcement 
agencies either lack the resources or 
impartiality to conduct the investigation. Its 
work on large-scale corruption scandals and 
serious criminal cases has garnered national 
and international recognition. 

3. Judicial Oversight : 

     The judiciary often entrusts the CBI with 
sensitive cases. This judicial oversight, 
especially by the Supreme Court and High 
Courts, provides additional credibility and 
ensures accountability in politically charged 
cases. 

4. Wide Jurisdiction and Cooperation : 

     The CBI has the authority to investigate cases 
across India with the consent of the states. It 
also cooperates with Interpol and other 
international law enforcement agencies in 
cases involving transnational crimes. 

5. Public Trust : 

     Despite challenges, the CBI is still regarded 
as a relatively impartial and competent agency 
by the public. It is often seen as the “last resort” 
for justice in cases where other agencies fail to 
perform. 

Challenges Facing the CBI : 

1.Political Influence : 

The most significant challenge facing the CBI is 
the persistent allegation of political interference. 
The agency is under the administrative control 
of the Ministry of Personnel, which reports to the 

Prime Minister’s Office. This structural 
relationship has led to accusations that the CBI 
is used to settle political scores, especially 
against opposition leaders. 

2. Structural and Functional Autonomy: 

     Various committees and experts have 
recommended granting the CBI more 
independence from the executive branch. 
Proposals include setting up a dedicated 
commission or board to oversee its functioning, 
thereby reducing political pressure. 

3. Resource and Staffing Constraints : 

     The CBI faces issues related to understaffing 
and insufficient resources. Its capacity to 
handle complex investigations is often limited 
by outdated equipment and lack of adequate 
personnel, leading to delays in the completion 
of investigations. 

4. Case Backlog and Delays : 

     Due to its wide-ranging jurisdiction and the 
increasing number of cases referred to it by 
courts and governments, the CBI often struggles 
with a backlog of cases, causing significant 
delays in delivering justice. 

5. Public Perception and Accountability : 

     Although the CBI enjoys considerable public 
trust, any perception of political bias or selective 
investigations erodes its credibility. High-profile 
cases, especially involving powerful figures, 
often attract intense scrutiny, and any failure to 
deliver timely results harms its image. 

Functions of the CBI: 

The primary functions of the CBI are as follows: 

1.Anti-Corruption Investigations: 

The CBI’s Anti-Corruption Division investigates 
cases of corruption involving public servants, 
especially those employed in central 
government departments, public sector 
undertakings, and financial institutions. 

It investigates bribery, misuse of office, and 
fraud, especially in government procurement 
and public services. 
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2. Economic Crimes: 

 The Economic Offenses Wing of the CBI deals 
with cases involving financial fraud, bank fraud, 
corporate fraud, money laundering, and 
violations of economic laws. 

 It investigates large-scale scams, 
embezzlement, tax evasion, and financial 
irregularities, especially those that have a 
significant impact on the national economy. 

3. Special Crimes: 

The Special Crimes Division handles serious 
criminal cases, such as murder, kidnapping, 
terrorism, organized crime, and cases involving 
human trafficking. 

It also investigates cases referred to it by the 
judiciary or state governments that are 
particularly complex or sensitive. 

4. Cybercrime Investigations: 

The CBI has a dedicated Cyber Crime Cell to 
investigate offenses involving the use of 
information technology, including hacking, data 
theft, online financial fraud, and child 
exploitation on the internet. 

5. Transnational Crimes: 

The CBI acts as the nodal agency for Interpol in 
India, coordinating with international law 
enforcement agencies to tackle cross-border 
crime, extradition, and offenses involving foreign 
jurisdictions. 

It deals with international terrorism, trafficking, 
smuggling, and other transnational crimes. 

6. Judicially Referred Cases: 

 Courts in India, especially the Supreme Court 
and High Courts, often direct the CBI to 
investigate cases where they feel the local law 
enforcement agencies have either failed or are 
perceived to lack impartiality. 

These are typically cases involving politically or 
socially sensitive issues. 

7. Investigations on the Request of State 
Governments: 

The CBI can take up cases referred to it by state 
governments. However, it needs the state’s 
consent, except in cases where it is directed by 
the courts. 

8. Liaison with International Agencies: 

The CBI coordinates with international bodies 
like Interpol and other foreign police agencies to 
track fugitives, solve cross-border crimes, and 
manage information sharing in global 
investigations. 

Structure of the CBI: 

The organizational structure of the CBI is 
designed to handle its wide range of functions 
efficiently. Below is an outline of its key divisions 
and hierarchy: 

1. Director of CBI: 

The Director is the head of the CBI and is 
appointed by a high-level committee, 
consisting of the Prime Minister, Leader of the 
Opposition, and the Chief Justice of India (or a 
Supreme Court judge nominated by the Chief 
Justice). 

The Director has a fixed tenure of two years, 
ensuring continuity and some degree of 
protection from political interference. 

2. Special Director/Additional Directors: 

Below the Director are Special Directors and 
Additional Directors. These officers assist in 
supervising and managing the operations of 
the different divisions of the CBI. 

3. Joint Directors: 

Joint Directors oversee various branches and 
zones. They ensure the smooth functioning of 
the respective departments, such as Anti-
Corruption, Economic Offenses, and Special 
Crimes. 

4. Deputy Inspectors General (DIG): 

The DIGs manage specialized units within the 
CBI, such as the Economic Offenses Wing and 
Special Crimes Division. They ensure the 
ope”ational tasks and investigations are carried 
out efficiently. 
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5. Superintendents of Police (SPs): 

SPs head investigation teams. They are 
responsible for managing the ground-level 
investigations and coordinating the collection 
of evidence, interviews, and reports. 

6. Investigation Teams: 

The CBI’s investigation teams typically consist of 
Investigating Officers (IOs), Sub-Inspectors, 
Constables, and other support staff, including 
legal and forensic experts. 

7. Specialized Divisions: 

Anti-Corruption Division: Investigates 
government corruption. Economic Offenses 
Wing: Focuses on financial fraud, bank scams, 
and corporate crimes. Special Crimes Division: 
Deals with serious crimes like terrorism, murder, 
and organized crime. Cyber Crime Cell: 
Investigates crimes related to IT and cyber 
fraud. Interpol Wing: Coordinates international 
investigations and handles extradition matters. 

8. Legal and Forensic Units: 

The CBI has its own Legal Division, which 
provides legal advice and represents the 
agency in court. 

The Central Forensic Science Laboratory (CFSL) 
under the CBI assists with forensic analysis and 
evidence collection in investigations. 

Role of the CBI: 

The CBI plays a critical role in maintaining law 
and order in India, especially in cases where 
local law enforcement agencies either fail or 
are perceived to lack impartiality. Its role 
extends to several important functions, as 
outlined below: 

1. Upholding the Rule of Law: 

The CBI is responsible for investigating and 
prosecuting violations of law, especially in 
cases of corruption, economic offenses, and 
serious crimes. Its investigations ensure that 
high-ranking officials, public servants, and 
influential figures are held accountable. 

 

 

2. Tackling Corruption: 

The CBI is tasked with addressing corruption 
within central government institutions and 
public-sector enterprises. Its investigations play 
a critical role in maintaining public trust in 
governance by holding corrupt officials 
accountable. 

3. Ensuring National Security: 

The CBI plays a significant role in investigating 
terrorism-related cases and transnational 
crimes, ensuring that threats to national 
security are neutralized. Its Special Crimes 
Division handles high-profile terrorism and 
organized crime cases. 

4. Protecting the Economy: 

With its Economic Offenses Wing, the CBI 
protects the country’s financial integrity by 
investigating large-scale scams, bank fraud, 
corporate fraud, and embezzlement. This helps 
safeguard India’s financial and corporate 
environment from corruption. 

5. High-Profile and Sensitive Cases: 

The CBI is often entrusted with investigating 
politically sensitive or high-profile cases that 
have wide-reaching consequences. This 
includes cases referred to it by state 
governments or those mandated by the 
Supreme Court. 

6. International Cooperation: 

The CBI serves as the national liaison agency for 
Interpol, coordinating with international law 
enforcement agencies to tackle global crime, 
extradition of fugitives, and exchange of 
criminal intelligence. 

7. Judicial Oversight: 

The judiciary often entrusts the CBI with 
investigations of cases where impartiality is 
paramount. Court-monitored investigations 
have helped maintain the agency’s integrity in 
sensitive cases, thus ensuring justice is served. 
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8. Law Enforcement Support: 

The CBI provides expertise to other law 
enforcement agencies, offering guidance in 
areas such as forensic science, cybercrime 
investigation, and advanced interrogation 
techniques. It assists local police in complex 
investigations. 

Relationship between the Central Bureau of 
Investigation (CBI) and the Police: 

The relationship between the Central Bureau of 
Investigation (CBI) and the state police forces is 
cooperative yet distinct in terms of roles, 
jurisdiction, and authority. Both agencies work 
towards maintaining law and order, 
investigating crimes, and upholding justice, but 
their operational spheres differ. Below is an 
overview of how the CBI and the police interact 
and coordinate. 

1. Jurisdiction and Authority: 

State Police: 

The state police have general jurisdiction over 
law enforcement and criminal investigation 
within their respective states. They investigate 
crimes under the Indian Penal Code (IPC) and 
other state-specific laws. The state police are 
under the control of the respective state 
governments and report to the Director General 
of Police (DGP). 

 CBI: 

 The CBI is a central agency with jurisdiction 
over cases involving corruption, economic 
offenses, and serious crimes with national or 
international implications. Its authority is 
granted 

by the Delhi Special Police Establishment Act 
(DSPE Act), 1946, and it typically requires the 
state government’s consent to investigate 
cases in a particular state unless directed by 
the Supreme Court or High Courts. 

The CBI operates under the administrative 
control of the Ministry of Personnel, Public 

Grievances, and Pensions in the central 
government. 

2. Types of Cases Handled: 

State Police: 

The state police handle the majority of criminal 
investigations in India, including routine crimes 
like theft, assault, murder, local fraud, and 
public disturbances. They are the **first 
responders** to most criminal activities and 
maintain law and order in their jurisdiction. 

 CBI: 

The CBI takes up cases of national importance, 
such as large-scale corruption, financial fraud, 
organized crime, and politically sensitive cases. 
It also deals with cases referred by the state 
police, courts, or central government where 
local investigations are inadequate or 
compromised. 

The CBI is often asked to intervene in complex 
cases, such as terrorism, human trafficking, and 
transnational crimes, where specialized 
expertise is required. 

3. Collaboration and Cooperation: 

Case Transfers: 

The CBI can take over investigations from the 
state police when requested by the state 
government or directed by the courts. In such 
cases, the state police hand over all 
investigation materials, including FIRs, evidence, 
and records, to the CBI. 

State police often assist the CBI in ground-level 
investigations, providing logistical support and 
local knowledge in cases where the CBI needs 
help during operations in different regions. 

 Joint Operations: 

 In certain situations, such as terrorism or 
organized crime that spans across multiple 
states, the CBI and state police may work 
together. Special Task Forces (STFs) are 
sometimes created with officers from both 
agencies to tackle specific cases. 
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Inter-agency communication and coordination 
are crucial, particularly when investigations 
cross state boundaries, where the state police’s 
involvement is necessary for local access and 
intelligence gathering. 

Training and Expertise Sharing: 

The CBI often shares its expertise and provides 
specialized training to the state police in areas 
like cybercrime, forensics, and advanced 
investigative techniques. The agency’s 
knowledge in handling complex financial crimes 
and forensic analysis is a valuable resource for 
local police forces. 

4. Challenges in Coordination: 

Jurisdictional Conflicts: 

Tension may arise over jurisdictional matters, 
particularly when the CBI takes over a case 
originally handled by the state police. In some 
instances, state governments may resist 
allowing the CBI to intervene, citing federalism 
concerns and the need for local autonomy. 

Cases involving political sensitivity often lead to 
friction, especially when allegations arise that 
the CBI is being used to undermine state 
authorities. 

Political Interference: 

The state police are directly controlled by state 
governments, while the CBI is under the central 
government’s control. This has led to 
accusations that both agencies are influenced 
by political powers. The state police may be 
perceived as favoring the ruling party in the 
state, while the CBI is sometimes viewed as 
acting in the interest of the central government. 

Such political dynamics can affect the 
coordination between the two agencies, 
particularly in high-profile or politically charged 
cases. 

5. Consent of States for CBI Investigations: 

 Under the DSPE Act, the CBI cannot investigate 
a case within a state without the consent of that 
state’s government, unless directed by the 
judiciary (Supreme Court or High Court). 

 Some states have withdrawn “general consent” 
for CBI investigations, requiring case-by-case 
approval for CBI involvement. This reflects 
tensions between state and central 
governments over the CBI’s role in state 
matters. 

6. Court-Mandated CBI Investigations: 

In certain cases, particularly those involving 
human rights violations, large-scale corruption, 
or failure of local investigations, the Supreme 
Court or High Courts may order the CBI to take 
over a case from the state police. 

This judicial intervention often happens when 
there are allegations of bias, inefficiency, or 
political interference in the state police’s 
handling of a case. In such scenarios, the courts 
view the CBI as a more neutral and independent 
investigating agency. 

7. Public Perception and Trust: 

 The CBI is often perceived as a more reliable 
and impartial agency, especially in politically 
sensitive cases, compared to state police 
forces, which are seen as being more 
vulnerable to local political pressures. 

Due to its central control and specialized 
capabilities, the CBI is generally entrusted with 
cases of greater national importance, leading 
to public expectations of a higher standard of 
investigation. 

Development and reforms of CBI: 

The development and reforms of the Central 
Bureau of Investigation (CBI) in India reflect its 
evolution from a small investigative agency into 
a premier institution tasked with handling 
complex and high-profile cases of national 
significance. Established in 1963 through an 
executive order, the CBI was initially created to 
investigate corruption and serious crimes 
affecting the central government. Over time, its 
mandate expanded to include a broader range 
of criminal activities, such as economic 
offenses, terrorism, and organized crime. 
Significant reforms began in the 1990s, driven by 
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increasing concerns over the agency’s 
independence and effectiveness.  

A landmark moment came with the Supreme 
Court’s judgment in Vineet Narain v. Union of 
India (1997), which mandated comprehensive 
reforms to protect the CBI from political 
interference and ensure its autonomy. This 
judgment led to the establishment of a high-
level selection committee for the appointment 
of the CBI Director, comprising the Prime 
Minister, the Leader of the Opposition, and the 
Chief Justice of India, aimed at depoliticizing 
the appointment process. Further reforms 
focused on procedural improvements and 
enhancing transparency in the CBI’s operations. 
The introduction of the Prevention of Corruption 
Act and amendments to various criminal laws 
facilitated the agency’s work by providing 
clearer guidelines and stronger legal tools for 
tackling corruption and economic crimes.  

Additionally, the CBI has been involved in 
significant capacity-building efforts, including 
the establishment of specialized units for 
financial crimes and cyber investigations. 
Despite these advancements, challenges 
persist, particularly regarding jurisdictional 
disputes and the CBI’s perceived vulnerability to 
political pressures. Some states have withdrawn 
general consent for the CBI’s investigations, 
reflecting tensions between state and central 
authorities.  

To address these issues, ongoing reforms aim 
to improve inter-agency coordination, enhance 
the CBI’s operational independence, and 
implement stricter accountability measures. As 
the CBI continues to adapt to the evolving 
landscape of crime and governance, its 
development underscores a commitment to 
strengthening India’s criminal justice system 
while striving to maintain its integrity and 
effectiveness amidst a complex political 
environment. 

Here are some significant case laws related to 
the Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI) in 
India: 

1. Vineet Narain v. Union of India (1997) 

Facts: 

This landmark case was brought before the 
Supreme Court to address issues related to the 
autonomy of the CBI and the role of the central 
government in its functioning. 

The petitioners challenged the alleged misuse 
of the CBI for political purposes and sought 
reforms to ensure its independence. 

Judgment: 

The Supreme Court ruled that the CBI should be 
given more autonomy to prevent its misuse for 
political purposes.  

The Court directed the establishment of 
guidelines for the CBI’s functioning, including 
the need for its Director to be appointed by a 
high-level committee consisting of the Prime 
Minister, the Leader of the Opposition, and the 
Chief Justice of India. 

This judgment led to the implementation of 
several reforms aimed at protecting the CBI 
from political interference and enhancing its 
independence. 

2. CBI v. State of Rajasthan (2001) 

Facts: 

In this case, the Supreme Court dealt with the 
issue of the CBI’s authority to investigate cases 
in states without their consent. 

The Rajasthan government had withdrawn 
general consent for the CBI to investigate 
crimes within its jurisdiction, challenging the 
CBI’s authority to operate there. 

Judgment: 

The Supreme Court upheld the CBI’s power to 
investigate cases in states, even if the general 
consent was withdrawn, provided it had specific 
permission or was directed by the court. 

The ruling clarified that the CBI can be assigned 
cases by the central government or ordered by 
the judiciary, even if the state government does 
not consent to its involvement. 

https://ijlr.iledu.in/
https://iledu.in/
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3. Subramanian Swamy v. Director, CBI (2014) 

Facts: 

The petitioner, Subramanian Swamy, sought the 
CBI’s involvement in a case of alleged 
corruption involving high-profile individuals. 

The main issue was whether the CBI could be 
directed by the court to investigate such cases 
even if the agency had not taken suo motu 
action. 

Judgment: 

The Supreme Court held that the CBI could be 
directed by the judiciary to investigate cases, 
particularly when there were allegations of 
serious corruption or when the investigation by 
other agencies was not satisfactory. 

This judgment reinforced the judiciary’s power 
to direct the CBI in high-profile or sensitive 
cases to ensure impartial and thorough 
investigations. 

Research findings : 

 Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI) highlight 
its critical role in India’s law enforcement 
landscape, marked by both strengths and 
challenges. Established in 1963, the CBI has 
evolved into a premier investigative agency 
responsible for tackling high-profile and 
complex cases, including corruption, economic 
crimes, and serious offenses. Key research 
indicates that while the CBI is praised for its 
specialized expertise and significant impact on 
national security and anti-corruption efforts, it 
faces ongoing challenges related to political 
influence and jurisdictional issues. Studies 
underscore the importance of maintaining the 
CBI's autonomy to prevent misuse and ensure 
impartiality, a concern addressed by landmark 
judgments like Vineet Narain v. Union of India.  

Conclusion: 

the Central Bureau of Investigation (CBI) 
remains a pivotal institution within India’s 
criminal justice system, tasked with handling 
some of the country’s most intricate and 
sensitive cases. Established to address high-

profile corruption, economic crimes, and serious 
offenses, the CBI’s role has grown increasingly 
critical in maintaining the integrity of public 
institutions and upholding national security. 
Despite its essential functions, the agency faces 
significant challenges, including political 
influence and jurisdictional complexities, which 
can undermine its effectiveness and 
impartiality. Landmark judgments have 
reinforced the importance of safeguarding the 
CBI’s autonomy and ensuring it operates with 
transparency and accountability. Moving 
forward, continuous reforms, strengthened 
inter-agency collaboration, and clear 
procedural guidelines will be vital in enhancing 
the CBI’s capacity to deliver justice impartially 
and effectively, thereby reinforcing public trust 
in its investigations. 
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